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Lot Title

0001 Vintage Brownie Camera in black case

0002 Vintage Brownie camera #2 in black box case

0003 Vintage Brownie Eastman Camera 

0004 Vintage Brownie Target six-20 camera

0005 Vintage Agfa PB20 camera

0006 Vintage Agfa Isloette camera

0007 Vintage Argus 75 Camera

0008 Vintage Imperial Debonair

0009 Vintage Ansco shur flash camera

0010 Vintage Ansco shur flash camera

0011 Vintage Brownie Target six-20 camera

0012 Vintage Ansco #2 camera in blue case

0013 Vintage Ansco B2 cadet camera

0014 Vintage Ansco Craftman Camera

0015 Vintage Ansco Shur Shot

0016 Vintage Ansco shur flash camera

0017 Vintage Kodak Brownie fun saver movie camera

0020 Vintage Ansco Commander Camera

0021 Vintage Kodak Holiday Flash Camera

0022 Vintage Brown Sawyers Nomad 127 camera

0023 Vintage Brownie Kodak Hawkeye camera

0024 Vintage Brownie Hawkeye camera

0025 Vintage Agfa shur shot camera

0026 Vintage Kodak holiday flash camera

0027 Vintage Brownie Target six-16 camera

0028 Vintage Voigtlander  camera

0029 Vintage Bolsey B2 with Original box 

0030 Vintage Minolta-16 EEII with leather case

0031 Vintage Polaroid Sun 600 camera

0032 Vintage Polaroid Q-light Land camera

0033 Vintage Polaroid Q-light Land camera

0034 Vintage Polaroid Sun camera 600

0035 Vintage brownie twin-20 camera

Lot Title

0036 Vintage Brownie six-20 camera

0037 Vintage Ansco Flash Clipper camera

0038 Vintage Spartus Press Flash camera

0039 Vintage Keystone K-7 8mm camera

0040 Vintage Brownie Hawkeye camera

0041 Vintage Brownie Bullseye camera

0042 Vintage Ansco Pioneer camera

0043 Vintage Spratus full view camera

0044 All on 4th shelf Vintage camera's and
camcorder

0045 All on 5th shelf of bookcase Camera's

0046 All on 6th shelf lot cameras

0047 All on 7th shelf books, magazines, barbie
camera, digital thermometer

0048 Vintage records lot 194 vinyl

0049 2 mobile hanging sculptures

0050 Small Wood display with pewter/metal animal
figures 13 total 8" by 15"

0051 All On medium wood display shelf animals
figures, candles, thimbles

0052 Collectible Metal See's Candy Truck

0053 Collectible Metal Van Lines World Mover's
Truck

0054 Collectible Metal Red Fire Engine Truck

0055 Collectible Metal Horse Carriage The Texas Co.

0056 Collectible Metal Green Dairi-Fresh Public
Truck

0057 Collectible Metal Permatex Truck

0058 Collectible Metal Castrol Semi-Truck

0059 Collectible Metal Shoprite Super Market Truck

0060 Collectible Coca-Cola Match Box Metal Truck

0061 Collectible Cast Iron Stove W/Pans, Weights, 3
Iron's

0062 Vintage Brownie Junior six-16 Camera
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0063 Vintage Ansco Shur Shot camera

0064 Vintage Brownie six-16 camera

0065 Vintage Argus 75 Camera

0066 Vintage Brownie 6-20 camera

0067 Target Brownie 6-20 camera

0068 Vintage Baby Brownie Camera

0069 Vintage Kodak Dualflex II Camera

0070 Vintage Star Flex Camera

0071 Vintage Brownie Holiday Flash Camera

0072 Vintage Imperial six-20 Camera

0073 Vintage Brownie Fiesta R4 Camera

0074 Vintage Scout 120 Flash Camera

0075 Vintage Ansco Lancer Camera

0076 Vintage Ansco Camera with Anscar Lens 

0077 Vintage Kodak Brownie 127 Camera

0078 Vintage Star Flash Brownie Camera

0079 Vintage Kodak Pony 135 Camera

0080 Vintage Kodak Holiday Flash Camera

0081 Vintage Starmite II Brownie Camera

0082 Vintage Kodak Brownie Starmite camera

0083 Vintage Vanguard Spartus camera

0084 Collectible Superman Electronic Talking Bank

0085 Ross Corporation Radio W/Lighter & Cigar
holder

0086 Collectible Spiderman Motion-Talking Bank
W/clock (2002) 

0087 Collectible Fantastic Four Silver Surfer Deluxe
Edition

0088 Collectible Batman Action Figure By Mattel

0089 Collectible Batman Beyond Action Figure

0090 Vintage Collectible's All on Top Shelf
Brownie, Wards 25, Kodak 127 etc.

0091 Vintage Collectibles All on  2nd to the top shelf
Brownie Bullet, Kodak 27 etc.

0092 Vintage Collectibles All on 3rd shelf Argus,
Bell & Howell etc.

0093 Vintage Collectibles All on 4th Shelf from top
Canon dial 35, Argus 260 etc

0094 Vintage Collectibles All on 5th Shelf
Automatic, Kodak Pony etc

0095 Vintage Collectibles Official Boy Scout 7 piece
flash camera set

0096 Vintage Collectibles Circo 35 alphamax camera

0097 Vintage Collectibles Argus C-44 camera

Lot Title

0098 Vintage Collectibles Argus Range Finder c-3
w/brown leather case

0099 Vintage Collectibles Brownie Reflux Eastman
Camera

0100 Collectible Metal Toy Coca-cola #1 car in case

0101 Vintage Wood Display Cabinet Glass Doors
and Drawer

0102 Collectible 2 Ceramic N'orleans Figures Made
in Japan

0103 Collectibles Vintage VW Pickup Hot Wheels

0104 Collectible Loco Puff-Puff Battery Operated
Train

0105 Collectible 47 Ford Coe Metal D-Rods Toy Car 

0106 Collectible 1956 Ford Pickup Coca-Cola Truck

0107 Collectible Hot Wheels Customized VW Drag
Bus

0108 Collectible Wood Castle W/Glass Canisters and
Shot Glasses

0109 Bulk Lot All on Shelf toy cars, trophy, figures

0110 Wood Collectible Liquor Cabinet With Glass
Contents inside

0111 Collectible Crosley Selecto-matic Radio replica

0112 2 Glass ceramic Swans and 2 Oriental style
pictures

0113 2 Lamps one Tiffany style and 1 Bar light

0115 Vintage Collectible White Ford Metal Toy
Truck

0116 Vintage Collectible C to C Metal Truck

0117 Vintage Collectible Metal True Values Semi
Truck

0118 Vintage Collectible Metal Kenworth Semi Truck

0119 Vintage Collectible Metal Walmart Semi Truck

0120 3 Wood Shelves 

0121 Vintage Electronic Lot with Stand

0122 Bulk lot with 86 Cds all in box

0123 Vintage Puerto Rico Map Wood Frame

0124 4 Faux Plants in Planters

0126 Vintage Collectible Wheaties cereal and Jake's
Cereal unopened

0127 Vintage X-Man Box Set with Motorcycle 

0128 2 Vintage Peanuts Snap Model Kit Cars

0129 Little Traveler Wind-up Courious George and
Radio Flyer Wagon

0130 Vintage Metal Universal Boat and Metal Rocket
Toy

0131 Vintage Metal Elephant with Plane Mobile 
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0132 Vintage Camera's Polaroid 210, Polaroid 80, 2
Kodak's

0133 Cast Iron Stove

0134 Vintage Cast Iron Ashtray with glass/crystal
ashtray

0135 Vintage Metal Milk Jug

0136 All Toys in Box 

0137 Vintage Cast Metal Car Bank

0138 Antique Collectible Cast Iron's and Metal Iron's

0139 Glass Lot Includes ash trays, vase, candy jar, oil
lamp

0140 Vintage Collectible Harley Plastic Tricycle

0141 Vintage Collectible X-Man Mega Armor Storm
Action Figure

0142 Vintage Collectible Star Wars Fighting Figures

0143 Vintage Bolta Flex Banquette and Wood table
included

0145 Bulk Lot All In Box Toy's Cowboy's in Moo
Mesa

0146 Vintage Collectible Star Trek Phaser Gun

0147 Vintage Collectible Star Trek Ceramic Mug 

0148 Vintage Collectible Star Trek Personnel
Communicator

0149 Vintage Collectible Star Trek Micro Machines

0150 Toy's Bulk Lot Train set, Domino's,3  hand
held games, bowling set, radio's

0151 Vintage etched mirror with wolf's

0152 Collectible Honey Frosted Wheaties With Troy
Aikman 

0153 Collectible Honey Frosted Wheaties  Cereal
with Ken Griffy Jr.

0154 Collectible Whole Wheat Wheaties Box of
Cereal with Joe Namath 

0155 Collectible Whole Wheat Weaties Cereal With
Roger Staubach Super bowl VI

0156 Starting Lineup Baseball Greats Willie Stargell
and Roberto Clemente

0157 Collectible Starting Lineup Baseball Greats
With Johnny Bench and Pete Rose 

0158 Collectible Starting Lineup Baseball Greats
With Reggie Jackson and Don Drysdale

0159 Collectible Starting Lineup Baseball Greats
with Mickey Mantel and Joe DiMaggio

0160 Collectible Starting Lineup Baseball Greats
with Babe Ruth and Lou Gehrig

0161 Collectible Starting Lineup Baseball Greats
with Willie McCovey and Willie May's

Lot Title

0162 Collectible Starting Lineup Baseball Greats
with Stan Musial and Bob Gibson

0163 Collectible Mark Maguire Action Figure

0164 Vintage MidCentury Modern Barstools

0165 Vintage MidCentury Modern Electric Vinyl
Lounger

0166 Vintage Hand Painted Black Wood Rocking
Chair

0167 Ceramic Brown and Yellow Tea Set 11 pieces

0168 Vintage Pair of Ruby Red Oil Lamps 

0169 Collectible Seagram's Glass Dispenser, Glass
Jar, Ice Bucket

0170 Vintage Collectible Fotron III, Polaroid sx-70,
Arrow view camera and film

0171 All on Wood Shelf Vintage Collectible
Superman Action figures, Batman figure and 2
cars 

0172 All on left side of the shelf includes all glass
container's and bottle's

0173 All on right side of shelf bottle's, can's
collectibles

0174 All on middle left side of shelf mugs, glasses,
collectibles

0175 All on right side of shelf glass, mugs and
collectibles.

0176 All on left side of shelf glass container's,
mug's, shot glasses

0177 All on right side of shelf glass container's,
mug's, bottles

0178 All on left side of this shelf bottles, can's,
glasses.

0179 All on right side of this shelf. Bottles, mugs and
collectibles

0180 All on left side of this shelf coffee, glasses,
cans, bottles

0181 All on right side of this shelf bottles

0182 All on top shelf under bar vinyl record's

0183 All on bottom Shelf under bar vinyl record's

0184 Aluminum signs all 3

0185 Vintage Collectible Lone Star Beer Wall Clock

0186 3 Bar Wall Hanging's included is Coffee sign,
Coors sign and Coca-Cola sign

0187 Vintage Collectible 2 Metal Iron's 

0188 Collectible String Guitar Wood

0189 Vintage Old Homestead 13 piece knife set with
counter block

0190 Walnut and Wood Mail Organizers 
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0191 Teak Wood Dancing Lady

0192 All with shelf Polaroid 660 and 600, ceramic
camera on tripod and black 18 inch shelf.

0193 Vintage Collectible Coors Hanging Light

0194 2 Kellogg's Special K Cereal with Kristie
Yamaguchi

0195 Corn Flakes cereal box with Nolan Ryan Texas
Ranger's Collectible

0196 1991 Baseball's Hottest Player's 2 Package's

0197 Vintage B-17 Wings with ladies metal sign

0198 Polaroid swinger model 20 in box

0199 Metal Tin Christmas Concert Singing stage

0201 All on top of laundry shelf

0202 All on top shelf of cabinet 

0203 All on Middle Shelf House Hold Items

0204 All on bottom shelf 

0205 JcPenny Dryer

0206 Bravos Washer Top Loader

0207 Vintage Playboy and Penthouse

0208 Vintage Ace Novelty Troll Dolls

0209 Vintage Gotz Puppe Doll

0210 Vintage Star Trek 

0211 Hamper and Ironing board

0212 5 Foot Aluminum Ladder

0213 2 Display cases 

0214 Toys Collectible 

0215 Toys Collectible Vintage

0216 Corner Shelf With Books and Dvds

0217 Stereo Records A track

0218 Vintage Records

0219 JcPennys Stand Up Freezer 

0220 Black and Decker Miter Saw

0221 Ryobi Biscuit Joiner

0222 Chicago Electric Oscillating Power Tool

0223 Bulk Hardware Cabinet

0224 Wood Display Wall Unit

0225 HDC Belt and Disk Sander

0226 Cabinet and Bulk Tools

0227 Metal filing cabinet

0228 Pasta Pro Stove Top Grill

0229 Paint Spray Gun 

0230 Bulk Toys

0231 J Eates Hat 

0232 Collectible Olympia Beer Clock

Lot Title

0233 Vintage Large Cans Of Beer

0234 Vintage Sealfest Milk Clock

0235 Vintage Schlitz Clock Sign

0236 Set of marble lamps 

0237 Decorative Plates and Knick knacks

0238 Vintage Tea Pots

0239 Vintage Metal Farris Wheel

0240 Metal and Wood Desk

0241 Door Handles and Locks

0242 Tool Box and Tools

0243 Tool Box and Tools

0244 Stanley Tool box and tools

0245 Tool Box and Tools

0246 Air Compressor and Air Ratchet

0247 Wall Organizer and Power Hammer

0248 Chicago Electric Power Sprayer

0249 10 Piece Hex Key Set

0250 Pittsburgh Coil Spring Compressor

0251 Bulk Lot Toaster and toys

0252 Bulk Toys

0253 Vintage Razors and cameras

0254 Bulk Household and Vintage Cameras

0255 Bulk Electrical Wire and Seat Cover

0256 Bulk Car Parts Welding Hood Electrical

0257 Metal Stand and Rolling cart

0258 Bulk Vinyl Records

0259 Vintage Timex Store Display

0260 Vintage Cameras 

0261 Vintage Cameras Bulk

0262 Vintage Cameras Bulk

0263 Vintage Cameras Bulk

0264 Vintage Cameras bulk

0265 Vintage Camera's Bulk

0266 Vintage Cameras Bulk

0267 Vintage Cameras and table

0268 Folding Table and Desk Chairs

0269 Books Paperback Hardback

0270 Christmas Decorations

0271 Collectible Toys Bulk

0272 Collectible Toys Bulk

0273 Bulk Toys

0274 Bulk Toys 

0275 Bulk Toys
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0276 Bulk Toys

0277 Collectible Toys Bulk

0278 Vintage Record Players Bulk

0279 Bulk Vintage Cameras

0280 Vintage Tri O Matic Radio

0281 Grinder and Stand

0282 Vintage Decca Radio

0283 Vintage Morse Record Player

0284 Metal Cabinet and all on

0285 Bulk Tools 

0286 Bulk DvDs Lot

0287 Old Wood Dresser

0288 Tools in Bulk On Cabinet

0289 Torch set in box

0290 Ramset Tools

0291 Cut off Saw and Horses

0292 Trailer Hitch in box

0293 B&K Drill  and Shear Cutter

0294 2 Reciprocating Saws

0295 Skil Belt Sander

0296 Skilsaw Tool

0297 Kett Drill and Black and Decker Saw

0298 Bulk Tools and Table

0299 Bulk Tools and Peg Board

0300 Cabinet and Hardware

0301 Craftsman Band Saw

0302 Industrial Jig Saw

0303 GMC Miter Saw

0304 Metal Desk and Tools Bulk

0305 Back Yard BBQ Set

0306 McCulloch Chain Saw

0307 CTT Drill Press

0308 Craftsman Weed Eaters

0309 Roll of Blue Wire

0310 Toys Bulk in box

0311 Gemeinhardt M2 Flute

0312 Texture Paint Sprayer

0313 Krause and Becker Spray Gun

0314 Chicago Electric Power Sprayer

0315 Chicago Electric Reciprocating Saw

0316 Cabinet and tools lot

0317 Bulk Tools 

0318 Chicago cut off saw

Lot Title

0319 Bulk tools with gray case

0320 Filing cabinet with contents

0321 Craftsman Bench Grinder

0322 Cabinet with all contents like nails, pumps, oil
and some other stuff in good condition.

0323 Bulk lot Welding Rods

0324 Craftsman Direct drive saw 

0325 Drill press

0326 Central pneumatic compressor

0327 Chicago Electric Finish Sander

0328 Black and Decker Finish Sander

0329 Black and Decker Palm Sander

0330 Makita Drill 

0331 Drill Master Heat Gun

0332 Black and Decker Circular saw.

0333 Cabinet lot with Spray paints

0334 4 Wheel barrow tires

0335 Bulk cabinet and hardware

0336 Wood Handle Tools

0337 Red Tool Box and Tools

0338 Lincoln Electric Stick Welder

0339 Cabinet with tool box and tools

0340 Bronco Ball bearing Grinder 

0341 Wood doors 

0342 Wood Door

0343 Wood Doors

0344 Sheetrock 

0345 Wood Door and Frame

0346 Wood Lattice

0347 Vanity Mirror 

0348 Rockwell Saw

0349 Wood Finials

0350 Aluminum Garage Sink

0351 Insulation R11

0352 Collectible Radio

0353 Bulk Glass Vases

0354 George Forman Grill

0355 Sango Majesty Dishes

0356 Bulk Kitchen Utensils

0357 Bulk Lot Hoses Car parts

0358 Coleman Camping Stove

0359 Spiderman Electric Pin Ball

0360 Bulk Toys
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0361 GE 4 Burner Stove

0362 Bulk Christmas Decorations

0363 Christmas Decoration 

0364 Wood Barn Toys

0365 Collectible Framed Center Folds

0366 Blue Outdoor Umbrella

0367 Fold out Table

0368 Kitchen Table

0369 Curio Mirror

0370 Wood Paneling

0371 Twin Box Springs

0372 Bulk Toys In barn

0373 Bulk Lot Front of Barn

0374 Aluminum Ladder

0375 Vinyl Bar and Lighting

0376 Garden push cart

0377 Metal Coupe 

0378 Bulk Wheelbarrows Bench

0379 Trailer with hitch

0380 Display Unit Case

0381 Red Wheel Barrow 

0382 Metal Anvil and Stand

0383 Wheel barrow 

0384 Cement mixer

0385 Door and Frame

0386 Wood Garden Tools

0387 McCulloch Chain Saw

0388 Tool boxes

0389 Bags of Bark 

0390 Metal Tool Box 

0391 Voit  workout bike

0392 Murray lawnmower

0393 Metal Car Ramps

0394 Metal saw horses

0395 2 Car Stands

0396 Bottles for Cutting Torch

0397 Metal Lounger

0398 Heavy Duty Dolly

0399 Montgomery Ward Rototiller

0400 Whites Rototiller

0401 Outdoor grills

0402 Plastic Pressure washer and tank

0403 Metal Tree Bench

Lot Title

0404 Cement Bird Bath

0405 Water fountain 

0406 Mother Theresa outdoor statue

0407 DynaGlo Grill

0408 Pickers Lot

0409 Weight Bench

0410 Wood Shelf 

0411 Wood Panels

0412 Weight Bench

0413 Bulk vinyl records

0414 Bulk Toys

0415 Ford pedal tractor

0416 Amity Glass Shelf

0417 Wagon Wheel

0418 Cast iron metal clock

0419 Metal Porch Swing

0420 Christmas Decorations and ceramics

0421 Tool box for truck bed
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PAYMENT DUEPlease log in and pay for your won items immediately after the auction ends. Go to My
Account, Invoices after the Auction ends to make payment and print your invoice.
If payment is not made with in 5hrs of the scheduled pick up, your payment method on file will be
automatically run.

REMOVALPick up will be by My Auction Addiction on Wednesday December 30th 9:00AM -6:00PM. 
Manual and Pennsylvania NE. Your invoice will have the exact location and directions, please print your
invoice and bring it with you to check off your items. For large re-seller lots you must take everything
including trash. Do not show up before or after established pick up hours.
COVID 19 PRECAUTIONS We are maintaining social distancing. Please spread out over the pickup
time and please maintain a 6-foot separation. Occupancy limits will apply based upon location. Please
wait outside or in your car if it is crowded. If you have a vulnerable health condition please use our
pickup service, or request curbside pickup for smalls or send someone else to pick up. If you are feeling
poorly please stay home. Bring a printed invoice and check in with greeter.
People with COVID-19 have had a wide range of symptoms reported ? ranging from mild symptoms to
severe illness. Symptoms may appear 2-14 days after exposure to the virus. People with these symptoms
may have COVID-19:

Fever or chills
Cough
Shortness of breath or difficulty breathing
Fatigue
Muscle or body aches
Headache
New loss of taste or smell
Sore throat
Congestion or runny nose
Nausea or vomiting
Diarrhea

When you are checked in at the pickup you certify that you do not have any of these symptoms! 
REMOVAL ASSISTANCEBuyers are solely responsible for the removal of purchased items. Bring help
for large items, tools for disassembly, ladders, Dollies as well as boxes and bubble wrap for smalls. If you
need help for moving large items please contact us in advance for a referral. We can provide general
moving, Hot Tub, Shed, Pool Table and other mover referrals.
PICKUP ASSISTANCEMy Auction Addiction can pick up your small items and bring them back to our
office for later pick up from our location off Tramway. This is for small items only, no furniture, no bulk
lots. We charge 5.00 for 1-4 items, 10.00 for 5-9 items, 20.00 for 10-20 items. Please email us your
request with auction name and your bidder number after the auction ends but, no later than 2 hours prior
to the pickup start time. Failure to request pickup service by email 2 hours before the pickup will result in
2 times the normal pickup fee as listed above. You may choose to not pick up and forfeit 1-2 small items
if do not wish to pay the pickup service fees, please also email us at least 2 hours prior to the pickup to
forfeit your items so no fees will not be added to your invoice. No refunds will be issued for any lots
forfeited.
SHIPPINGIf you require shipping please email us after the auction ends. We will pick your items up on
Pick Up Day, then calculate shipping and any packaging costs plus a 5.00 fee and invoice you for
payment. Once the shipping invoice is paid we will ship your items out. Due to the wide range of items
we sell we do not estimate shipping on each item in advance.
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Buyer's Premium: There is a 10.000% Buyer's Premium in effect for this auction.

529 Chama RD, NE, Albuquerque, NM 87108 -- Phone +1-505-252-0915
albuquerqueauctionaddiction.com
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